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Mark Tatulli is a cartoonist, illustrator, and author best known for his popular
comic strip "Lio." Tatulli has also illustrated numerous children's books and
created several animated television series. In this article, we will take a
closer look at Tatulli's life and work, and explore what makes him such a
beloved figure in the world of comics.

Early Life and Career

Mark Tatulli was born in 1967 in New Jersey. He began drawing at a young
age, and by the time he was in high school, he was already selling his
cartoons to local newspapers. After graduating from high school, Tatulli
attended the School of Visual Arts in New York City, where he studied
cartooning and illustration.

In 1990, Tatulli created the comic strip "Lio." The strip follows the
adventures of Lio, a small, white dog with a big personality. "Lio" quickly
became popular with readers, and it was soon syndicated in newspapers
across the country.

Lio

"Lio" is a slice-of-life comic strip that follows the everyday adventures of Lio
and his friends. The strip is known for its humor, heart, and whimsical
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artwork. Tatulli has said that he created "Lio" as a way to express his own
love of dogs and to share his unique perspective on the world.

Over the years, "Lio" has become one of the most popular comic strips in
the world. The strip has been translated into over 20 languages, and it has
been adapted into several animated television series.

Other Work

In addition to "Lio," Tatulli has also illustrated numerous children's books,
including "The Cat Who Wore Pants" and "The Dog Who Ate the Moon."
He has also created several animated television series, including "The
Mighty B!" and "Bunnicula."

Tatulli's work has been praised for its humor, heart, and originality. He is a
master of both the comic strip and the children's book, and he has created
some of the most beloved characters in the world.

Mark Tatulli is a true talent in the world of comics. His work is funny,
heartwarming, and original. He is a master of both the comic strip and the
children's book, and he has created some of the most beloved characters
in the world. If you are not already familiar with Mark Tatulli's work, I
encourage you to check it out. You won't be disappointed.
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